

FY -2022
Material, Equipment, and Labor Bid Package
Bid Tab for Bids Opened November 12, 2021 at 9:00 AM

Bituminous		GOH, Inc.		HRI, Inc.		Russell Standard					
		Pick Up	Delivered	Pick Up	Delivered	Pick Up	Delivered				
B-1	BCBC (25 mm) Ton	\$53.00	No Bid	\$59.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
B-2	ID-2 Wearing (9.5 mm) Ton	\$65.00	No Bid	\$69.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
B-3	ID-2 Binder (19 mm) Ton	\$60.00	No Bid	\$64.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
B-4	ID-3 Wearing (19 mm) Ton	\$60.00	No Bid	\$64.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
B-5	25 MM Binder Ton	\$53.00	No Bid	\$59.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
B-6	QPR - 2000 Ton	\$150.00	No Bid	\$100.00	No Bid	\$128.00	No Bid				
Bituminous Prime Coat											
P-6	E1 Prime Gal	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.95	\$2.55				
P-7	Fog Seal SY in place.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.55				
Aggregate											
A-7	AS2 or AS4 ton	\$15.75	\$20.75	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
A-8	2A Ton	\$11.00	\$16.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
A-9	2B ton	\$13.00	\$18.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
A-10	2RC ton	\$11.00	\$16.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
A-11	#3 Stone Ton	\$13.00	\$18.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
A-12	#4 Stone Ton	\$13.00	\$18.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
A-13	DSA Ton	\$17.00	\$22.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid				
Equipment											
		Hourly Rate		Hourly Rate		Hourly Rate					
E-13	Backhoe	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid					
E-14	Dump Truck	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid					
E-15	Pick up/Snow Plow/Spreader	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid					
E-16	Skid loader	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid					
E-17	Mini Excavator under 40HP	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid					
E-18	Trackloader	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid					
E-19	Truck/Snow Plow/Spreader	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid					
Laborer											
L-22	General Laborer/Flagger	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid					

No Bids received for Items, B1, through B5 (Delivered), P-7 (Pick Up), E-13,E-14, E-15, E-16, E-17, E-18, E-19, and L-22
Low bids are in red.

Report prepared 11/14/2021